
Supplier Network Management

Náplň práce

1.Supplier Onboarding & Integration

1) Collaborate with plant procurement, Transportation, and SAP teams
to onboard suppliers into systems

2) Facilitate cross-functional alignment (Finance, Operations) for smooth
transition and order fulfillment

3) Develop supplier performance scorecards and conduct periodic
reviews

  -ASN improvement

  -PSM improvement

2. Strategic Suppliers' SC Performance monitor and development at
Supplier and Plant side

1) Plant supplier Delivery Performance improvement

2) Training of Bensberg & SC Complaints 

3) Supplier SCM Performance urgent case support 

4) create and maintain reports relative to supplier SCM performance

3. BASE SCM evaluation

1) MMOG/LE consultant to Plants and Suppliers 

2) Summarize/escalate Asia SCM operations issues of strategic suppliers
to final SCM potential evaluations.

4.Risk Management & Continuous Improvement

1) Monitor supplier risks (supply disruptions, geopolitical issues) and
develop contingency plans.

2) Implement supplier diversity and sustainability initiatives (e.g., local
sourcing, carbon footprint reduction).

3) Identify opportunities for supplier consolidation or diversification.

4) SCM Supplier coach: improvement project for cost reduction, and
delivery performance improvement
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1) Bachelor's degree or similar

2) 3–5 years in semiconductor or consumer electronics industry
planning team, supplier development, or supply chain management.

3) Proficiency in ERP systems and procurement tools.

4) Strong data analysis (Excel, Power BI)

5) Excellent negotiation, communication, and stakeholder management.

6) Problem-solving mindset with a focus on risk mitigation.

7) Certifications (Preferred): CSCP, CPSM, or equivalent.

Čo ponúkame

Ready to take your career to the next level and join us at the start of
something extraordinary? Apply now to become a part of AUMOVIO and
drive the future mobility together with us!

O nás

Continental’s Automotive group sector is expected to be listed as
independent company “AUMOVIO” in September 2025. With ~93,000
employees worldwide and annual sales of ~€20 billion, we are entering
an exciting new era.

AUMOVIO stands for highly developed electronic products and modern
mobility solutions. In addition to its strong market position with
innovative sensor solutions, displays, and technologically leading
braking and comfort systems, AUMOVIO has significant expertise in
software, architecture platforms and assistance systems for the rapidly
growing future market of software-defined and autonomous vehicles.
Our purpose is clear: to make future mobility safe, exciting, connected,
and autonomous.


